
 
 

Argos Risk presenting at  
INNOVATE  

2019 SAI Global Customer Conference 
“How to Defraud a Company in Three Easy Steps” 

 

MINNEAPOLIS, MN – March 5, 2019 - Argos Risk is pleased to announce Kevin Sasser, 
Director of Sales and Strategic Initiatives, will present at SAI Global’s INNOVATE Customer 
Conference in Orlando March 6th. “The INNOVATE Conference is a great venue to kick-off our 
newly announced partnership with SAI Global,” said Sasser. 

With the increasing scrutiny on the risks associated with third-party vendor risk management, 
Argos Risk and SAI Global have been working together on an integrated solution that enables 
organizations to manage a holistic view of a third-party relationship. With data from Argos Risk, 
critical insights related to a third-party’s financial viability are quickly and easily accessed from 
within the SAI enterprise risk management suite.  

This presentation will provide best practices and current examples of why financial viability is 
the cornerstone of an effective third-party vendor assessment. Sasser will also share how easily 
financial viability can be incorporated into third-party risk management strategy. 

About Kevin Sasser
  
As Director of Sales and Strategic Initiatives for Argos Risk, Kevin Sasser works with hundreds 
of organizations in implementing best practices related to continuous third-party risk mitigation 
programs. As a dynamic, nationally known speaker, he delivers keynote addresses to financial 
and risk management conferences with an authentic, straight-forward message laced with 
humor, personal experience, and no-nonsense advice. 
 
 
About Argos Risk  
 
Argos Risk is a leading provider of Third-Party Risk Intelligence solutions. Formed in 2010, we 
are experts in Third-Party Risk Intelligence services to fulfill a need for timely and 
comprehensive risk mitigation knowledge. We provide innovative and affordable subscription 
services that help companies manage the risk associated with their third-party relationships; 
such as Vendor Management, ACH/RDC originators and lending clients – direct and indirect, 
and Supply Chain Management.  

For additional information, visit www.argosrisk.com. 

http://www.argosrisk.com/


About SAI Global 

SAI Global helps organizations proactively manage risk to create trust and achieve business 
excellence, growth, and sustainability. SAI Global’s integrated risk management solutions are a 
combination of leading capabilities, services and advisory offerings that operate across the 
entire risk lifecycle allowing businesses to focus elsewhere. Together, these tools and 
knowledge enable clients to develop an integrated view of risk. Their global reach includes 
locations across Europe, the Middle East, Africa, the Americas, Asia and the Pacific. 

For more information, visit www.saiglobal.com. 
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